
 

Highlands Ranch Aquatics 2021-2022 Season 

PARENT CODE OF CONDUCT CONSENT FORM 

All HRA competitive programs where athletes, coaches, or parent volunteers are sponsored by, or 
represent HRA, require that parents accept the Parent Code of Conduct as a condition of participation. 

PARENT GUIDELINES 

As a member of HRA, parents are expected to abide by the following guidelines: 

1. Practice TEAMWORK with other parents, athletes and coaches by supporting the team Philosophies & 
Objectives. 

2. Refrain from coaching or instructing the team or any athlete at practice or at meets (from the stands or 
any other area) or interfere with coaches on the pool deck. 

3. Demonstrate good sportsmanship by conducting themselves in a manner that earns the respect of their 
child, other athletes, parents, officials and the coaches at meets and practices. 

4. Maintain self-control at all times. Know the parent’s role, and the role of others. 

· ATHLETES: Swim 

· COACHES: Coach 

· OFFICIALS: Officiate 

· PARENTS: Parent 

5. Understand that criticizing, name-calling, use of abusive language or gestures directed toward any 
coach or official, and participating athlete as well as any and all members of HRA, will not be permitted or 
tolerated. 

6. Enjoy involvement with HRA by supporting the athletes, coaches and other parents with positive 
communication and actions. 

7. During competitions, questions or concerns regarding decisions made by coaches or meet officials are 
to be directed to a member of our coaching staff. Parents should address officials via the HRA coaching 
staff only. 

8. Outside of competitions, parents should conduct themselves in a befitting manner at all facilities 
(recreation facility, hotel, restaurant, etc.) during any team function. 

9. Fulfill the Financial & Volunteer policy requirements. 



10. Fulfill assigned volunteer shift obligations. If the volunteer cannot work a scheduled shift, it is 
the PARENT’S RESPONSIBILITY to find a substitute, or a missed shift fine of $50 will be assessed. 

11. Volunteer during HRA hosted meets. If a family does not fulfill a volunteer shift obligation at an 
HRA hosted meet, a missed shift fine of $100 will be assessed. 

12. Adhere to HRA’s Social Media Policy. 

13. Adhere to HRA’s Anti-Bullying Policy. 

14.  Adhere to HRA’s Minor Athlete Abuse Prevention Policy (MAAPP), 

15. Adhere to HRA’s Inclusion of Transgender Athlete Policy 

Miscellaneous  
The rules and regulations included in this Parent Code of Conduct agreement are NOT inclusive. 
Amendments to this form as well as to HRA’s financial obligations and all other HRA rules and regulations 
may be made from time to time as necessary by the HRA Board and coaches. On all questions regarding 
the interpretation of and application of HRA’s rules and regulations, the decision of the HRA Board and 
coaches shall be final.  

PARENT(S) 

As a parent or guardian of a member of HRA, I have read and agree to comply with the terms of the HRA 
Parent Code of Conduct Consent Form. Should I conduct myself in such a way that brings discredit or 
discord to Highlands Ranch Aquatics, or USA Swimming, I will voluntarily subject myself to disciplinary 
action. HRA maintains the right to terminate any membership, with proper cause, in the interest of our 
Philosophies & Objectives. 

 

 
 


